
 Where are  

CALLING ALL GIRL GUIDES AND 

BROWNIES... 

you now? 

Remember your guiding days?  
We would love you to share your skills and experience! 

Guiding is a place where girls and 
young women can challenge  
themselves, put their ideas into  
action, take part in an amazing range 
of activities, and gain the skills to 
confidently navigate their world. All 
in a safe and supportive environment 
that welcomes every girl. 
 
Girls take what they do in guiding 
with them as they grow up. From 
working in a team, to taking the lead, 
to speaking out on issues they care 
about, to contributing to their  
communities. It helps them develop 
the skills and confidence to become 

the young women they want to be. 
And to make a difference to the 
world around them. 
 
Girl Guides SA is keen to engage with 
past Guides and Brownies to inspire 
today’s girls and young women now 
seeking the same adventure, fun and 
friendships they enjoyed. From  
running a Guide Unit, to contributing 
your expertise and experience in 
other ways we would love to hear 
from you call 8418 0900 or go to: 
https://www.girlguidessa.org.au/
calling-all-girl-guides-and-brownies/ 
and click on the buttons. 


